Stellantis
Sedans, SUVs, Vans
Bid Year or Current
Code Make Model Pro$uction Body style Trim Level Drive Gregg Young Gene Steffy Anderson Auto
ear

S1 Chyrsler Pacifica (gas) B 3.6L V6 N/A N/A 3.6L V6 N/A N/A 3.6L V6 N/A N/A
S1A1 Chrysler Voyager 2026 Van LX FWD [No Bid $39,549 $39,990
S1A2 | Chrysler Pacifica (gas) 2026 Van Select FWD [No Bid $40,665 $41,560

S1B Chrysler Pacifica (gas) 2026 Van Select AWD [No Bid $43,466 $44,381

J1 Dodge Hornet 2.0L Turbo N/A N/A |2.0L Turbo N/A N/A |2.0L Turbo N/A N/A
J1A Dodge Hornet 2026 SUV GT AWD [No Bid NO BID NO BID

Durango 3.6L V6 N/A N/A 3.6L V6 3.6L V6
S3A Dodge Durango 2026 SUV GT AWD [No Bid $36,844.00 $38,227.00
S3B Dodge Durango 2026 SUV GT Plus AWD [No Bid $40,324.00 $41,837.00
Compass 3.6L V6 N/A N/A 2.0L 14 2.0L 14

J3A Jeep Compass 2026 SuUv Sport AWD [No Bid NO BID NO BID

J3B Jeep Compass 2026 SUV Latitude AWD [No Bid $30,290.00 $29,455.00

J2 Jeep Grand Cherokee 2.0L Turbo| 5.7L V8 3.6L V6 5.7L V8 N/A 3.6L V6 5.7L V8 N/A
J2A Jeep Grand Cherokee 2026 SuUvV WL74 4X2 [No Bid No Bid NO BID NO BID $37,287 NO BID

J2B Jeep Grand Cherokee 2026 SUV WL74 4X4 |No Bid No Bid NO BID NO BID $39,249 NO BID

J2 Jeep Grand Cherokee (3 Row) 3.6L V6 5.7L V8 N/A 3.6L V6 5.7L V8 N/A | 3.6L V6 5.7L V8 N/A
J2C Jeep Grand Cherokee (3 Row) 2026 SUV WL74 4X2 |No Bid No Bid NO BID NO BID $39,249 NO BID

J2D Jeep Grand Cherokee (3 Row) 2025 SUV WL74 4X4  |No Bid No Bid NO BID NO BID $41,209 NO BID

J6 Jeep Wrangler 2.0L Turbo(3.0L Diesel|3.6L V6(2.0L Turbo|3.0L Diesel|3.6L V6(2.0L Turbo|3.0L Diesel|3.6L V6
JBA Jeep Wrangler 2026 SuUvV JL 4x2  |[No Bid No Bid No Bid [NO BID NO BID NO BID[NO BID NO BID NO BID
J6B Jeep Wrangler 2026 SUV JL 4x4  |No Bid No Bid No Bid [$35,608 NO BID NO BID [$36,021 NO BID $33,571
Provide a standard percentage (%) discount for additional Manufacturer Models not listed above or that may

have not been released at the time of this bid. No Bid 5% 5%
NOTE: DISCOUNT PERCENT (%) SHALL BE OFF OF CURRENT MANUFACTURER MSRP




Stellantis
Light & Heavy Duty Trucks

[

Bid Year or Cu.rrent . .
Code Make Model Cab | Bed Pro;iuctlon Body style Trim Drive Gregg Young Gene Steffy Anderson Auto
ear
R1 RAM 1500 — 3.0L 16 | 3.0L High Output 3.6L V6 3.0L 16 3.0L High Output 3.6L V6 3.0L 16 3.0L High Output 3.6L V6
R1A RAM 1500 Quad | 6'4" 2026 Truck Bighorn 4x2 No Bid |No Bid No Bid $40,293.00 |NO BID 38,784.00 $41,812.00 |NO BID $40,227.00
R1A RAM 1500 Quad | 6'4" 2026 Truck Tradesmen 4x2 No Bid |No Bid No Bid $40,146.00 [NO BID 38,637.00 $37,246.00 [NO BID $35,661.00
R1B RAM 1500 Quad | 6'4" 2026 Truck Tradesmen 4x4 No Bid |No Bid No Bid $39,406.00 |NO BID 37,897.00 $40,580.00 [NO BID $38,995.00
R1B RAM 1500 Quad [ 6'4" 2026 Truck Bighorn 4x4 No Bid [No Bid No Bid $43,587.00 |NO BID $42,078.00 $44,780.00 [NO BID $43,194.00
R1 RAM 1500 3.0L 16 | 3.0L High Output 3.6L V6 3.0L 16 5.7L V8 HEMI 3.6L V6 3.0L 16 3.0L High Output 3.6L V6
R1C RAM 1500 Crew | 57" 2026 Truck Bighorn 4x2 No Bid |No Bid No Bid $42,337.00 |$43,579.00 $40,828.00 $43,560.00 [NO BID $41,975.00
R1C RAM 1500 Crew | 5'7" 2026 Truck Tradesmen 4x2 No Bid [No Bid No Bid $38,180.00 [$39,422.00 $36,671.00 $39,192.00 |NO BID $37,607.00
R1D RAM 1500 Crew | 5'7" 2026 Truck Tradesmen 4x4 No Bid [No Bid No Bid $41,531.00 [$42,773.00 $40,022.00 $42,509.00 |NO BID $40,924.00
R1D RAM 1500 Crew | 5'7" 2026 Truck Bighorn 4x4 No Bid [No Bid No Bid $45,684.00 [$46,926.00 $44,175.00 $46,789.00 |NO BID $45,204.00
R1 RAM 1500 3.0L 16 | 3.0L High Output 3.6L V6 3.0L 16 3.0L High Output 3.6L V6 3.0L 16 3.0L High Output 3.6L V6
R1E RAM 1500 Crew | 6'4" 2026 Truck Bighorn 4x2 No Bid [No Bid No Bid $43,678.00 [NO BID NO BID $44,983.00 |NO BID NO BID
R1E RAM 1500 Crew | 6'4" 2026 Truck Tradesmen 4x2 No Bid [No Bid No Bid $39,573.00 [NO BID NO BID $40,626.00 |NO BID NO BID
R1F RAM 1500 Crew | 6'4" 2026 Truck Tradesmen 4x4 No Bid [No Bid No Bid $42,916.00 |NO BID NO BID $44,351.00 |NO BID NO BID
R1F RAM 1500 Crew | 6'4" 2026 Truck Bighorn 4x4 No Bid [No Bid No Bid $47,031.00 [NO BID NOBID $48,087.00 |NO BID NO BID
R2 RAM 2500 6.4L V8|  6.7L Diesel 6.4L V8 6.7L Diesel 6.4L V8 6.7L Diesel
R2A RAM 2500 Reg 8 2026 Truck Bighorn 4x2 No Bid |No Bid $41,382.00 [NO BID $42,187.00 [$54,275.00
R2A RAM 2500 Reg 8' 2026 Truck Tradesmen 4x2 No Bid [No Bid $40,032.00 |NO BID $38,740.00 |$50,840.00
R2B RAM 2500 Reg 8' 2026 Truck Tradesmen 4x4 No Bid [No Bid $42,484.00 [$53,697.00 $41,507.00  [$53,607.00
R2B RAM 2500 Reg 8' 2026 Truck Bighorn 4x4 No Bid |No Bid $43,831.00 |$55,044.00 $44,985.00 [$57,085.00
R2 RAM 2500 6.4L V8|  6.7L Diesel 6.4L V8 6.7L Diesel 6.4L V8 6.7L Diesel
R2C RAM 2500 Crew | 6'4" 2026 Truck Bighorn 4x2 No Bid [No Bid $44,657.00 |$55,870.00 $46,191.00 [$58,197.00
R2C RAM 2500 Crew | 6'4" 2026 Truck Tradesmen 4x2 No Bid [No Bid $41,472.00 |$52,685.00 $42,159.00 [$54,187.00
R2D RAM 2500 Crew | 6'4" 2026 Truck Tradesmen 4x4 No Bid |No Bid $43,924.00 [$55,137.00 $44,884.00 [$56,893.00
R2D RAM 2500 Crew | 6'4" 2026 Truck Bighorn 4x4 No Bid {No Bid $47,105.00 |$58.318.00 $48,468.00 |$60,568.00
R2 RAM 2500 6.4L V8|  6.7L Diesel 6.4L V8 6.7L Diesel 6.4L V8 6.7L Diesel
R2E RAM 2500 Crew | 8 2026 Truck Bighorn 4x2 No Bid |No Bid $44,837.00 |$56,050.00 $45,891.00 [$57,896.00
R2E RAM 2500 Crew 8' 2026 Truck Tradesmen 4x2 No Bid [No Bid $41,653.00 |$52,866.00 $42,348.00  [$54,457.00
R2F RAM 2500 Crew 8' 2026 Truck Tradesmen 4x4 No Bid [No Bid $44,105.00 [$55,318.00 $44,926.00 [$57,085.00
R2F RAM 2500 Crew | 8 2026 Truck Bighorn 4x4 No Bid |No Bid $47,286.00 |$58,499.00 $48,657.00  [$60,698.00
R2 RAM 2500 6.4L V8|  6.7L Diesel 6.4L V8 6.7L Diesel 6.4L V8 6.7L Diesel
R2G RAM 2500 Mega | 6'4" 2026 Truck Bighorn 4x2 No Bid [No Bid NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
R2G RAM 2500 Mega | 6'4" 2026 Truck Tradesmen 4x2 No Bid [No Bid NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
R2H RAM 2500 Mega | 6'4" 2026 Truck Tradesmen 4x4 No Bid [No Bid NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
R2H RAM 2500 Mega | 6'4" 2026 Truck Bighorn 4x4 No Bid [No Bid NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
R3 RAM 3500 6.4L V8|6.7L Diesel Turbo|6.7L Diesel HO| 6.4L V8 6.7L Diesel Turbo | 6.7L Diesel HO 6.4L V8 6.7L Diesel Turbo | 6.7L Diesel HO
R3A RAM 3500 Reg 8 2026 Truck Bighorn 4x2 No Bid |No Bid No Bid $42,268.00 |NO BID NO BID 43,415.00 |$55,470.00 $57,685.00
R3A RAM 3500 Reg 8 2026 Truck Tradesmen 4x2 No Bid |No Bid No Bid $40,918.00 [NO BID NO BID 39,873.00 [$51,973.00 $54,268.00
R3B RAM 3500 Reg 8 2026 Truck Tradesmen 4x4 No Bid |No Bid No Bid $43,569.00 [NO BID $54,782.00 42,640.00 |$54,687.00 $57,064.00
R3B RAM 3500 Reg 8' 2026 Truck Bighorn 4x4 No Bid [No Bid No Bid $44,917.00 |NO BID $56,130.00 $46,183.00 [$58,097.00 $60,197.00
R3 RAM 3500 6.4L V8|6.7L Diesel Turbo|6.7L Diesel HO| 6.4L V8 6.7L Diesel Turbo | 6.7L Diesel HO 6.4L V8 6.7L Diesel Turbo | 6.7L Diesel HO
R3E RAM 3500 Crew | 6'4" 2026 Truck Bighorn 4x2 No Bid |No Bid No Bid $45,542.00 |NO BID $56,755.00 $46,636.00 |NO BID $58,692.00
R3E RAM 3500 Crew | 6'4" 2026 Truck Tradesmen 4x2 No Bid [No Bid No Bid $42,149.00 [NO BID $53,362.00 $43,481.00 |NO BID $55,537.00
R3F RAM 3500 Crew | 6'4" 2026 Truck Tradesmen 4x4 No Bid |No Bid No Bid $44,800.00 [NO BID $56,013.00 $46,059.00 [NO BID $51,115.00
R3F RAM 3500 Crew | 6'4" 2026 Truck Bighorn 4x4 No Bid [No Bid No Bid $48,191.00 |NO BID $59,404.00 $49,642.00 |NO BID $61,658.00
R3 RAM 3500 6.4L V8|6.7L Diesel Turbo|6.7L Diesel HO| 6.4L V8 6.7L Diesel Turbo | 6.7L Diesel HO 6.4L V8 6.7L Diesel Turbo | 6.7L Diesel HO
R3I RAM 3500 Crew 8' 2026 Truck Bighorn 4x2 No Bid [No Bid No Bid $45,723.00 |NO BID $56,936.00 $46,825.00 |NO BID $58,881.00
R3I RAM 3500 Crew 8' 2026 Truck Tradesmen 4x2 No Bid [No Bid No Bid $42,330.00 |NO BID $53,543.00 $46,059.00 |NO BID $57,415.00
R3J RAM 3500 Crew 8' 2026 Truck Tradesmen 4x4 No Bid [No Bid No Bid $44,981.00 |NO BID $56,194.00 $46,197.00 |NO BID $58,253.00
R3J RAM 3500 Crew | 8 2026 Truck Bighorn 4x4 No Bid |No Bid No Bid $48,372.00 |NO BID $59,585.00 $49,790.00 [NO BID $61,846.00
R3 RAM 3500 6.4L V8|6.7L Diesel Turbo|6.7L Diesel HO| 6.4L V8 6.7L Diesel Turbo | 6.7L Diesel HO 6.4L V8 6.7L Diesel Turbo | 6.7L Diesel HO
R3M RAM 3500 Mega | 6'4" 2026 Truck Bighorn 4x2 No Bid [No Bid No Bid NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
R3M RAM 3500 Mega | 6'4" 2026 Truck Tradesmen 4x2 No Bid [No Bid No Bid NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
R3N RAM 3500 Mega | 6'4" 2026 Truck Tradesmen 4x4 No Bid [No Bid No Bid NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
R3N RAM 3500 Mega | 6'4" 2026 Truck Bighorn 4x4 No Bid [No Bid No Bid NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
rovide a standard p (%) for Models not listed above or that may
have not been released at the time of this bid. No Bid 5% 5%

NOTE: DISCOUNT PERCENT (%) SHALL BE OFF OF CURRENT MANUFACTURER MSRP




Stellantis

Emergency Services

Year or Current

Body

NOTE: DISCOUNT PERCENT (%) SHALL BE OFF OF CURRENT MANUFACTURER MSRP

Bid Code| Make Model Pro(Yiuction style Drive| Gregg Young Gene Steffy Anderson Auto
ear
SP1 Jeep Hurricane Twin Turbo Hurricane Twin Turbo Hurricane Twin Turbo
SP1A | Jeep Wagoneer 2026 Suv 4x4 No Bid NO BID $ 58,458.00
SP1B | Jeep \Wagoneer L 2026 SUvV 4x4 No Bid NO BID $ 61,335.00
SP2_|Dodge Durango Pursuit 3.6L V6 5.7L V8 3.6L V6 3.6L V6 5.7L V8
SP2A |Dodge Durango Pursuit 2026 SUV__|AWD| § 39,187.00 | $ 42,005.00 $ 39,202.00 $ 40,372.00 | $ 43,287.00
SP3 _|Dodge| Ram 1500 Special Service Cab |Bed 3.0L 16 57LV8 3.6L V6 3.0L 16 3.6L V6 5'7" Bed 3.0L 16 3.0L High Output 3.6L V6 5'7" Bed
SP3A |Dodge Ram 1500 Special Service Crew| 57" 2026 Truck  |RWD No Bid No Bid No Bid NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SP3B_|Dodge Ram 1500 Special Service Crew| 57" 2026 Truck | 4x4 | § 41,349.00 | § 42,591.00 | § 39,840.00 [ $ 43,925.00 [ § 45,370.00 [ § 42,419.00 | § 42,987.00 | NO BID $ 41,686.00
SP3 _ |Dodge| Ram Heavy Duty Special Service| Cab [Bed 6.4L Hemi 6.4L (Diesel) | 6.7L High Output (Diesel) 6.4L Hemi 6.4L (Diesel) | 6.7 High Output (Diesel) 6.4L Hemi 6.4L (Diesel) | 6.7 L High Output (Diesel)
SP3A |Dodge| Ram Heavy Duty Special Service [REG| 8' 2026 Truck 4X4 | $ 40,779.00 |No bid $52,002.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SP3B |Dodge| Ram Heavy Duty Special Service |Crew|6' 4"| 2026 Truck | 4x4 | § 43,644.00 |No Bid $54,857.00 $ 46,205.00 [NO BID $ 57,418.00 |$45,357 NO BID $57,389.00
SP3A |Dodge| Ram Heavy Duty Special Service |Crew| 8 2026 Truck 4X4 | $ 43,825.00 [No Bid $55,038.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Provide a standard percentage (%) discount for additional Manufacturer Models not listed above or that
may have not been released at the time of this bid. 5% 5% 5%




